
 

 
“Providing a safe, caring community and comfortable homes to independent seniors on limited income.” 

 
 

 

 

 
INVITATION TO HOUSING LEADERS 

 
Mount Douglas Seniors Housing Society is offering an exciting and rewarding opportunity to 
interested volunteers who are considering a role in community service. Our organization requires 
a diverse group of individuals whose expertise varies and who can work collaboratively to achieve 
our stated goals. 
 
MDSHS is a not-for-profit Society that has successfully provided comfortable, affordable 
independent housing to older adults for over 50 years. With the opening of our newest award- 
winning building in 2019, we now operate 164 units. Our success is rooted in effective 
management, fiscal prudence, and a resident-centered approach. Our campus is professionally 
managed by an Executive Director and five staff. 
 
If you have a background in housing, non-profit leadership, social work, law, accounting, 
engineering, construction, health, community development, or geriatrics, we can use your talents 
and experience. For those wishing to gain professional development credits, this is an 
opportunity to give back to your community by directly impacting local affordable housing issues. 
If you’re looking for a renewed focus in retirement, your life experience and wisdom is valuable 
to us.  
 
The major responsibilities of the MDSHS board include providing safe, comfortable tenant 
accommodation, developing, and monitoring our strategic plan, ensuring fiscal oversight to an 
annual approved budget, recruiting new board members, hiring, and evaluating the Executive 
Director, establishing policies and procedures, and ensuring a safe working environment for staff 
and residents. 
 
Thank you for taking the time to consider this invitation. For more general Society information 
please visit:  https://www.mdshs.net 
 
How to apply for a volunteer board position please visit: https://www.mdshs.net/careers/ 
 
Please e-mail your interest in becoming a volunteer board member to info@mdshs.net and a 
current board director will be in touch with you. 
 
Sincerely 
 
Jane Mason 
MDSHS Board Chair  

Mount Douglas Seniors Housing Society 

100 – 1552 Arrow Rd. 
Victoria, BC V8N 0B8 
250-721-1818 
info@mdshs.net 
www.mdshs.net 
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